

ARCHITECHNICS

architects • engineers • interior designers

BID TABULATION SHEET

Client: Brown County Community Unit School District

Project Name: Roof Replacement

Project Number: 6364

Date: January 12, 2023

Time: 2:00 PM

BID FORM ITEM / CATEGORY		GENERAL CONTRACTOR / BIDDER				
		Full Service Roofing	Peters Heating & Air	River City Roofing	Baney Const.	
1.A	Base Bid "A"	\$ 3,100,000.00	\$ 2,820,900.00	\$ 2,800,000.00	not read - no bond	
1.B	Insulation Cost Included in Bid	\$ 895,000.00	\$ 950,000.00	not listed	not read - no bond	
1.C	Allowance Included in Bid	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	
1.D	Total Base Bid 'A'	\$ 3,100,000.00	\$ 2,820,900.00	\$ 2,800,000.00	not read - no bond	
2.A	Base Bid "B"	\$ 3,538,000.00	NO BID	\$ 2,980,000.00	not read - no bond	
2.B	Insulation Cost Included in Bid	\$ 162,600.00	NO BID	not listed	not read - no bond	
2.C	Allowance Included in Bid	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	
2.D	Total Base Bid 'B'	\$ 3,538,000.00	NO BID	\$ 2,980,000.00	not read - no bond	
3.A	Base Bid "C"	NO BID	\$ 2,585,600.00	\$ 3,500,000.00	not read - no bond	
3.C	Allowance Included in Bid	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	
3.D	Total Base Bid 'C'	NO BID	\$ 2,585,600.00	\$ 3,500,000.00	not read - no bond	
4.A	Alternate Bid "A-1"	\$ 220,000.00	\$ 223,960.00	NO BID	not read - no bond	
5.A	Alternate Bid "C-1"	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	not read - no bond	
6.A	Alternate Bid "D"	\$ 107,000.00	\$ 125,000.00	NO BID	not read - no bond	
4	Bid Security / Bid Deposit	YES	YES	YES	NO	
6	Acknowledgement of Addenda	2	2	2	not read - no bond	