
Bidder Bidder Bidder Bidder

ITEM CAT. TYPE # Latest Estimate Estimate Date Allowances Included in Bids Cardinal Environmental Operations Midwest Service Group Thornburgh Abatement AC Environmental

1.0 A 6004 $47,172.00 2021.01.27 Contingency A-1: $5,000 $69,532.00 $51,800.00 $34,650.00 $50,000.00

2.0 B 5998 $511,028.00 2021.03.10 Contingency B-1: $40,000 no bid no bid no bid no bid

3.0 C 6003A $672,750.00 2021.03.11 Contingency C-1: $25,000 no bid no bid no bid no bid

4.0 D 6003B $601,548.75 2021.03.10
Contingency D-1: $15,000               

Signage D-2: $7,500
no bid no bid no bid no bidB
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Asbestos Abatement

ITEM

5.0 E 6036 $708,943.75 2021.03.10

Contingency E-1: $20,000               

Signage E-2: $2,500                                        

Dust Collection E-3: $20,000

no bid no bid no bid no bid

6.0 F - - -

Contingency F-1: $75,000               

Signage F-2: $10,000                                       

Dust Collection F-3: $20,000

no bid no bid no bid no bid

7.0 B-1 5998

8.0 D-1 6003B

9.0 D-2 6003B

10.0 E-1 6036

11.0 E-2 6036

12.0 E-3 6036

COMBINED BID (2 + 

4 +5)

ADD AC TO EXT'G 

SHOP

ADD AC TO NEW 

SHOP

AG ADDITION 4620 

SF

A
LT

E
R

N
A

T
E

 B
ID

S

LVT IN LIEU OF VCT

EXPOSED 

FASTENER ROOF

STICK FRAMED 

CONSTRX

EXPOSED 

FASTENER ROOF 

13.0 E-4 6036

14.0 yes yes yes yes

15.0 4 4 4 4

16.0 6003A

17.0 6003B

18.0 6036

19.0 6003A

20.0 6003B

21.0 6036

B-2

STICK FRAMED 

CONSTRX

BID SECURITY INCLUDED? Y/N

# of ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED - 4

U
N
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R
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E
S

A-1
Remove and 

replace unsuitable 

mat'l 

Rock excavation 

and replacement 

SHOP

22.0 6003A

23.0 6003B

24.0 6036

25.0 D-4 6003B

26.0 E-5 6003a

C-3
Cut and replace 

exterior sidewalks

Gravel excavation 

and replacement 

U
N
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 P

R
IC

E
S

(2) 2" lifts of 

asphalt



Bidder Bidder Bidder

ITEM CAT. TYPE # Latest Estimate Estimate Date Allowances Included in Bids George Lee Construction Fisher Tracks Byrne & Jones

1.0 A 6004 $47,172.00 2021.01.27 Contingency A-1: $5,000 no bid no bid no bid

2.0 B 5998 $511,028.00 2021.03.10 Contingency B-1: $40,000 no bid no bid no bid

3.0 C 6003A $672,750.00 2021.03.11 Contingency C-1: $25,000 $883,600.00 $848,522.00 $747,500.00

4.0 D 6003B $601,548.75 2021.03.10
Contingency D-1: $15,000               

Signage D-2: $7,500
no bid no bid no bid
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Track and Field Reno

ITEM

B
A

S
E

 B
ID

S

ASBESTOS 

ABATEMENT  9090 

SF                                  

INTERIOR 

RENOVATIONS                                    

TRACK AND FIELD 

RENO

FIELD BUILDING       

3285 SF

5.0 E 6036 $708,943.75 2021.03.10

Contingency E-1: $20,000               

Signage E-2: $2,500                                        

Dust Collection E-3: $20,000

no bid no bid no bid

6.0 F - - -

Contingency F-1: $75,000               

Signage F-2: $10,000                                       

Dust Collection F-3: $20,000

no bid no bid no bid

7.0 B-1 5998

8.0 D-1 6003B

9.0 D-2 6003B

10.0 E-1 6036

11.0 E-2 6036

12.0 E-3 6036

A
LT

E
R

N
A

T
E

 B
ID

S

LVT IN LIEU OF VCT

EXPOSED 

FASTENER ROOF 

STICK FRAMED 

CONSTRX

EXPOSED 

FASTENER ROOF 

ADD AC TO EXT'G 

SHOP

ADD AC TO NEW 

SHOP

AG ADDITION 4620 

SF

COMBINED BID (2 + 

4 +5)

13.0 E-4 6036

14.0 yes yes yes

15.0 4 4 4

16.0 6003A no bid $83.00 $35.00

17.0 6003B -

18.0 6036

19.0 6003A no bid $222.00 $275.00

20.0 6003B -

21.0 6036

BID SECURITY INCLUDED? Y/N

# of ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED - 4

U
N

IT
 P

R
IC

E
S

A-1
Remove and 

replace unsuitable 

mat'l 

B-2
Rock excavation 

and replacement 

SHOP

STICK FRAMED 

CONSTRX

22.0 6003A no bid $111.00 $8.00

23.0 6003B -

24.0 6036

25.0 D-4 6003B -

26.0 E-5 6003a no bid $33.00 no bid

U
N

IT
 P

R
IC

E
S

C-3
Cut and replace 

exterior sidewalks

Gravel excavation 

and replacement 

(2) 2" lifts of 

asphalt



Bidder Bidder Bidder Bidder Bidder

ITEM CAT. TYPE # Latest Estimate Estimate Date Allowances Included in Bids Bleigh Freise Schwada Wright Construction Heimer Construction

1.0 A 6004 $47,172.00 2021.01.27 Contingency A-1: $5,000 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

2.0 B 5998 $511,028.00 2021.03.10 Contingency B-1: $40,000 $625,000.00 $519,400.00 no bid $748,500.00 $655,540.00

3.0 C 6003A $672,750.00 2021.03.11 Contingency C-1: $25,000 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

4.0 D 6003B $601,548.75 2021.03.10
Contingency D-1: $15,000               

Signage D-2: $7,500
$736,000.00 $679,000.00 $795,271.00 no bid $872,335.00

Int. Reno; Field Building; Ag Addition

FIELD BUILDING       

3285 SF
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ITEM

B
A

S
E

 B
ID

S

ASBESTOS 

ABATEMENT  9090 

SF                                  

INTERIOR 

RENOVATIONS                                    

TRACK AND FIELD 

RENO

5.0 E 6036 $708,943.75 2021.03.10

Contingency E-1: $20,000               

Signage E-2: $2,500                                        

Dust Collection E-3: $20,000

$807,999.00 $715,000.00 $650,036.00 no bid $842,528.00

6.0 F - - -

Contingency F-1: $75,000               

Signage F-2: $10,000                                       

Dust Collection F-3: $20,000

$2,093,000.00 $1,821,500.00 no bid no bid $2,340,403.00

7.0 B-1 5998 Add $34,900.00 Add $50,000.00 no bid add $50,500.00 add $36,137.00

8.0 D-1 6003B deduct $3398.00 deduct $10,000.00 deduct $15,000.00 no bid deduct $28,070.00

9.0 D-2 6003B no bid deduct $9,800.00 no bid no bid add $29,264.00

10.0 E-1 6036 deduct $2,588.00 deduct $9,900.00 deduct $20,000.00 no bid deduct $34,887.00

11.0 E-2 6036 add $52,000.00 add $42,900.00 add $35,855.00 no bid add $53,455.00

12.0 E-3 6036 add $26,500.00 add $9,900.00 add $11,275.00 no bid add $25,129.00

AG ADDITION 4620 

SF

COMBINED BID (2 + 

4 +5)

A
LT

E
R

N
A

T
E

 B
ID

S

LVT IN LIEU OF VCT

EXPOSED 

FASTENER ROOF 

STICK FRAMED 

CONSTRX

EXPOSED 

FASTENER ROOF 

ADD AC TO EXT'G 

SHOP

ADD AC TO NEW 

SHOP

13.0 E-4 6036 no bid deduct $6,000.00 no bid no bid deduct $15,813.00

14.0 yes yes yes yes yes

15.0 4 4 4 4 4

16.0 6003A

17.0 6003B $175.00 $50.00 no bid $56.79

18.0 6036 $175.00 $50.00 $120.00 $56.79

19.0 6003A

20.0 6003B $250.00 $145.00 no bid $77.72

21.0 6036 $250.00 $145.00 no bid $77.72

BID SECURITY INCLUDED? Y/N

# of ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED - 4

U
N

IT
 P

R
IC

E
S

A-1
Remove and 

replace unsuitable 

mat'l 

B-2
Rock excavation 

and replacement 

SHOP

STICK FRAMED 

CONSTRX

22.0 6003A

23.0 6003B $20.00 $7.00 no bid $21.85

24.0 6036 $20.00 $7.00 no bid $21.85

25.0 D-4 6003B $150.00 $39.00 no bid $59.03

26.0 E-5 6003a

U
N

IT
 P

R
IC

E
S

C-3
Cut and replace 

exterior sidewalks

Gravel excavation 

and replacement 

(2) 2" lifts of 

asphalt


